KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCGIETY,.,

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)

EXTENSION NOTICE
L

Brae s e

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS,

Name of work Amount Cost EMD Class Period

KMSCL - Construction

of a bridge for

the support of the

medical gas pipe

line system at

District Hospital

Palakkad Rs. 5,95,842/- 1200 +18% G5T g950/- C 1 month

ok e o ok

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from  08-07-2022 to 13- 07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 11-07-2022 to 15-07-2022 12.00 AM

#*#¥**poeoistered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under
REVERSECHARGEMECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Inyvoice with
Technical bid.
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/LfTMan ing Director

?egistamd Dﬂ‘_il:e ¢ General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road | Thiruvananthapuram - 695 035
elephone : Office - 0471 2306623 , Tele Fax . 0471 2304012 | Email |T&_rti.hhrw":2f=‘tE@Qmaiq.cuﬁu



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)

BREE s oz e sm wpamss

08-07-2022

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS.

Name of work  Amount Cost EMD Class Period

NHM- Construction

of Dialysis patients

wailing area and

Doctors rooms

at Community

Health Centre

at Shornur,

Palakkad Rs. 11,36,685/- 2500 +18% GST 17100/- C 2 manths

e ok e

Only one bid submitted, Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 08-07-2022 to 13-07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 11-07-2022 to 15-07-2022 12.00 AM

*#*#%% Ragistered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under REVERSE
CHARGE MECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with Technical
bid.

Oﬂf;rf ﬂﬂ/ .

it Managing Director

EXTENSION NOTICE Date ...,

Registered Office : General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road | Thiruvananthapuram - 685 035
Telephone : Office : 0471 23068623 . Tele Fax ;0471 2304012 | Emall : mdkhrws2018@gmail.com



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)
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12-07-2022
EXTENSION NOTICE

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS,

Name of work Amount Cost EMD Class Period

KHRWS- Canstruction

of RCC Ground

level tank for

collecting water

from KWA pipe

line for preventing

the shortage of

water in the

KHRWS Paywards

at Peroorkada. Rs. 4,45,236/- 900+18% GST  6700/- D 1 month
e T

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 25-07-2022 12.00 AM

**EXE* Registered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under REVERSE
CHARGE MECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with Technical

bid.
f{ﬂq Manag‘(ng Director

pital Campus, Red Cross Road , Thiruvananthapuram - BO5 035

i i ' General Hos! _
Regqistered Office | Genera e v ATY 2304p12 [Envall ndkhrws2018@gmail.com

Talaphone , Office : 0471 2306623



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of HtleraIa}ru'm'z‘:’22

EXTENSION NOTICE

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS.

Name of work Amount Cost EMD Class Period

NHM - Upgradation
of subcentre Perumbaddam
(Chaliyar PHC/FHC) in

Malappuram District Rs. 5,29,639/- 1100 +18% GST 7950/- C 2 months
e e

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 20-07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

##%%%% pooistered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under REVERSE
CHARGE MECHANISM., Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with Technical
bid.
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Registered Office : General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road , Thiruvananthapuram - B95 035
Telephone ;. Office - 0471 2306623 |, Tele Fax : 0471 2304012 | Email . mdkhrws2018@gmall.com



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)
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EXTENSION NOTICE

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS.,

Name of work Amount Cost EMD Class Period

NHM - Upgradation

of subcentre to

Health and wellness

centre Moorkkanadu

(Kolathur PHC/FHC)

in Malappuram

district Rs. 5,30,159/- 1100 +18% GST 8000/- C 2 months
EREEEE

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 20- 07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

w*#%% Rogistered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under REVERSE
CHARGE MECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with Technical
bid.

Sd/-

Managing Director

Eegsstered Office : General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Read | Thiruvananthapuram - 635 035
1= - % YL Bl o o Ly - e : - i g
Talephone - Office - 0471 2306623 , Tele Fax . 0471 2304012 | Emall : mdkhrws2018i@amail com
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KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)

BBL: & iy s s s ppnmnsagsses

T2-07-202L

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS.

Mame of work Amount EMD Cost Class Period

NHM - Upgradation
of subcentre to Health
& Welfare centre
Muthukkurissy
(Elemkulam)

in Malappuram

(District) Rs.5,21,139 /- 7,850/- 1100 +18% GST C 2 months
EEE R

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 20-07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

sxx***Rapistered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18% under
REVERSECHARGEMECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with
Technical bid.
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Managiﬁéﬂireﬁtor

Registered Office : Genaral Hospital Campus, Red Cross Raad , Thiruvananthapuram - 685 0335
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Telephone : Office : 0471 2306623 , Tele Fax . 0471 2304012 | Emall - mdkhrws2018@gmail.com

EXTENSION NOTICE Baibe: i dni



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)

12-07-2022
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EXTENSION NOTICE

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS,

Name of work Amount Cost EMD  Class Period

NHM - Upgradation

of Sub Centre to

Health and Welfare

Centre at Maliyakkal

(Chokkad PHC/FHC)

in Malappuram District Rs.5,11,877/- 1100 +18% GST 7700/- C 2 months

e o e e

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 20-07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

*¥X***Registered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under
REVERSECHARGEMECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with

Technical bid.
)
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,53" Managifg Director

Registered Office : General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road [Hiruvananthapuram - 895 038
Telephone * Office, D471 2306623 , Tele Fax : 0471 2304012 | Emall | mdkhrws20 \8@gmall corm



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)
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12-07-2022
EXTENSION NOTICE

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS.

Name of work Amount Cost EMD Class Period

NHM- Upgradation

of Sub Center to
Health and welfare
centre at Thekkinkode
(Perinthalmanna) in

Malappuram District Rs. 5,20,591/- 1100 +18% GST 7850/- C 2 months
R

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from  12-07-2022 to 20- 07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

*®#*%# pagistered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under REVERSE
CHARGE MECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with Technical

bid.
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Registered Office : General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road | Thiruvananthapuram - 685 035
Telephone | Office ;: 0471 2306623 | Tele Fax : 0471 2304012 | Emall © mdkhrws2018@gmail.com



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)

Date ! i)

12-07-2022

EXTENSION NOTICE

Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS.

Name of work Amount Cost EMD Class Period

NHM - Up Gradation

of Sub Centre to

Health & Welfare

Centre at Kuzhincholam

(Kuzhimanna CHC/FHC)

in Malappuram District Rs. 5,18,734/- 1100 +18% GST 7800/- C 2 months
ok ko

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 20-07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

****¥*Registered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under
REVERSECHARGEMECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with

Technical bid.
»
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Irr?’Man ing Director

Registared Office : General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road | Thiruvananthapuram - 695 035
i_n'-'ri:;;;phC'ﬂE‘ Office © 0471 2306623 , Tele Fax : 0471 2304012 | Email | mgkhrws2018@gmail com



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)

12-:07-2022
B ey p
AL s st it EXTENSION NOTICE
Notice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
contractors in KHRWS.
MName of work Amount Cost EMD Class Period

NHM-Upgradation

of Sub Centre

Karikkad

(Thrikkalangode PHC/FHC)

at Malappuram District Rs. 5,15,406/- 1100 +18% GST 7750/- C 2 months

o o

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 20- 07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22- 07-2022 12.00 AM

Yr¥*¥*Registered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under
REVERSECHARGEMECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with
Technical bid.

/L
fﬂ’ Managifig Director

Registered Office | General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road , Thiruvananthapuram - 895 035
Telephone : Office - 0471 2306623 |, Tele Fax ; 0471 2304012 | Email.: mdkhrws2018@amail,com



KERALA HEALTH RESEARCH & WELFARE SOCIETY

(An Institution fully owned by the Government of Kerala)

12-07-2022
Ref: e DETE S E R AR R T
EXTENSION NOTICE
Naotice inviting tenders for the following works from the registered
cantractors in KHRWS.
Name of work Amount EMD Cost Class Period
NHM - Upgradation
of Sub Centre at
Narokkavu
(Vazhikkadavu PHC/FHC)
in Malappuram
District Rs. 5,44,449/- 8200/- 1100 +18% GST i 2 months

& w0 ok

No bid submitted. Hence date is extended

Bid submission end date extended from 12-07-2022 to 20-07-2022 12.00 AM

Bid opening date extended from 14-07-2022 to 22-07-2022 12.00 AM

*EX®**Registered contractors has to pay to GST @ 18 % under
REVERSECHARGEMECHANISM. Bidders should submit GST Remittance Invoice with

Technical bid.
( Fl’ff"‘ﬂ:ﬂi/

Managing Director

Reglstered Office : General Hospital Campus, Red Cross Road = Thiruvananthapuram - 695 035
Fe!;,phﬂne Office : 0471 2306623 |, Tele Fax : 0471 2304012 | Email : mdkhrws2018@gmail com



